
 

 

MORPETH SECONDARY 
SCHOOL 

 
 
 

Portman Place, E2 0PX 

HEAD OF MATHS 

Contract Type:  Permanent 

Salary:  Inner London Main / Upper Scale + TLR 1D (£14,732) 

Start date: January 2024 
 

Closing date for all 
applications:  

12:00 (noon) Friday 6th October 2023 

 

We are looking to appoint a head of mathematics who is not just passionate about 
mathematics, but also about instilling an appreciation of the joy of mathematics in the 
students we proudly serve. Our vision of mathematics is fundamentally an inclusive 
one in that we believe that the knowledge and virtues wrought by mathematics, 
its beauty and humanity, help us all to flourish. As our new Head of mathematics, 
supported by three post holders, you will be instrumental in leading a department of 
dedicated teachers to realise and sustain this vision from key stage 3 to 5.   
 
We want our students to be curious about their mathematics, and work to equip them 
with the deep, coherent understanding of mathematics necessary for procedural 
fluency to follow. We have high expectations of ourselves and our students, and work 
hard to ensure that our students mature, mathematically and relationally, intellectually 
and emotionally, in a safe, supportive, challenging, and creative environment that 
fosters the highest aspirations.  
 
We are a proudly inclusive community school committed to learning and achievement, 
based on friendship and respect, where everyone is valued. The successful candidate 
will join a school that is proud of the strong and supportive relationships that exists 
between staff, and between staff and students, where staff wellbeing is paramount, 
and where and the diversity of the community we serve is celebrated. Discover more 
by visiting our website at www.morpethschool.org.uk  

Closing date: 12:00pm Friday 6th October 2023. Interviews TBC 

We are committed to safeguarding our students.  Successful candidates will be required 
to abide by the school’s Safeguarding Children policy and undergo an enhanced DBS 
check. 

For further details and application form, see the documents below. For enquiries, email 
recruitment@morpeth.towerhamlets.sch.uk, or ring us on 020 8981 0921. 

How to apply:  
 
For full details and application pack see the school website www.morpethschool.org.uk  or 

if necessary email recruitment@morpeth.towerhamlets.sch.uk or phone 020 8981 0921.  

Please note - we do not accept CVs without applications. 
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